
 

 
Data Processing Policy 

 
1. The Controller of the personal data is Conotoxia Ltd., a company incorporated and 

registered in Cyprus with its registered office at Chrysorroiatissis 11, Limassol, 
Cyprus, conducting business in Poland in the form of a branch of a foreign 
entrepreneur - Conotoxia Ltd. Branch in Poland with its registered office in Warsaw at 
123A Jerozolimskie Avenue. The Controller can be contacted via email at 
compliance@cy.conotoxia.com. 

2. Following our obligation under the GDPR and to better protect your rights concerning 
processing your personal data, we have appointed a Data Protection Officer. You can 
contact the Data Protection Officer via email at compliance@cy.conotoxia.com. 

3. In order to receive marketing material containing forecasts for 2024, you must 
consent to be contacted and provided with marketing content by email and telephone. 
The Controller will process your personal data for the purpose of direct marketing (the 
legal basis for processing: consent - Article 6(1)(a) of the GDPR, Article 10(2) of the 
Act on Provision of Electronic Services, Article 172(1) of the Telecommunications 
Act). By granting your consent to be contacted and provided with marketing content, 
you consent to processing your personal data for direct marketing purposes. 

4. The provision of personal data is voluntary but necessary to receive marketing 
content. The following personal data will be processed: name, surname, email 
address and telephone number. Recipients of personal data may be entities that 
support the Controller's activities (Processors), particularly regarding the provision of 
ICT solutions used by the Controller. 

5. Your personal data may be transferred to third countries (outside the EEA) - e.g. the 
USA, as we use the IT services of international providers. If we share your data with 
entities that are outside the EEA, we make sure that these entities provide an 
adequate level of protection and that the transfer is supported by appropriate 
safeguards, including but not limited to European Commission adequacy decisions or 
European Commission standard contractual clauses. Any questions regarding the 
transfer outside the EEA, including information on the safeguards in place, can be 
emailed to compliance@cy.conotoxia.com. 

6. Your personal data will be processed and stored for the period necessary to fulfil the 
purpose stated in paragraph 3, but no longer than 6 months. If you wish to withdraw 
your consent to the processing of your personal data, please contact us by phone at 
+357 250 300 46 or by email at support@cy.conotoxia.com. 

7. You have the right to access your personal data and rectify them, erase them (where 
legally permissible) and limit their processing as well as data portability. Moreover, 
you have the right to withdraw your consent at any time without affecting the 
lawfulness of the processing carried out based on consent before its withdrawal. For 
questions regarding the processing of your personal data, please get in touch with the 
Controller by email at compliance@cy.conotoxia.com. You also have the right to 
lodge a complaint with the supervisory authority in the field of personal data 
protection, which is the Personal Data Protection Office. 

 


